FILED 20220329

IN THE OFFICE OF THE
CLERK OF SUPREME COURT

PRESIDING JUDGE NOVEMBER 25, 2022 JUDICIAL REFEREE
GARY H, LEE STATE OF NORTH DAKOTA KELLY A. DILLON
(701} 857-6637 (701) 857-6645

DISTRICT JUDGES DISTRICT COURT FAX

DOUGLAS L. MATTSON (701) 857-6649
(701) 857-6635
Rlc\g}{’;ﬁlg; ?g\]gAR SCHEDULING
. (701) 857-6628
State of North Dakota
L DiSTRICTCOUKT —
NORTH CENTRAL JUDICIAL DISTRICT AN
STACY J. LOUSER Ward County Courthouse CAROLYN PROBST
(701) 857-6633 3153¥StSE PO Box 5005 (701) 857-6625

Minot ND 58702-5005

November 25, 2022

Sarah Erck

Deputy Clerk

North Dakota Supreme Court
supclerkofcourt@ndcourts.gov

RE: CDIJ Opportunities v. Harris, et al.
Ward County Case No. 51-2022-CV-01563
Supreme Court No. 20220329

Ms. Erck,

I have received a copy of your November 9, 2022, correspondence to Mr. Pierce Harris
stating the due date of the transcript on appeal is January 8, 2023.

Pursuant to Appellate Rule 10(b)(3), I suspend preparation of the transcript due to
nonpayment of the estimated cost. I have attached a copy of my November 9, 2022, email to Mr.
Harris which was my written and timely estimate and demand for payment.

Sincerely,

NITRA P. LATTA
Electronic Court Recorder/Transcriptionist

Attachments

cc:  Pierce Harris (harrispierce88@gmail.com)
Remington M. Kostenko - e-served
Shannah Renaud, I.ead Court Reporter (srenaud@ndcourts.gov)
Clerk of District Court copied via filing in Odyssey



Latta, Nitra

From: Latta, Nitra

Sent: Tuesday, November 22, 2022 6:07 PM

To: Rico Nonya

Subject: Re: Transcript [nvoice - CDJ Opportunities v. Harris, et al,, 51-2022-CV-01563

Hello, I'm following up on the payment for requested transcripts. Tomorrow will be 14 days from the date that
the invoice and request for payment was sent. If payment is not received, | will file a suspension of
preparation for the transcript. Please let me know if you wish to proceed with this request and if/when
payment will be sent.

Nitra P, Latta

Electronic Court Recorder

North Central Judicial District

(701) 857-6639, nlatta@ndcourts.gov

From: Rico Nonya <harrispierce88@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 9, 2022 4:19 PM

To: Latta, Nitra

Subject: Re: Transcript Invoice - CDJ Opportunities v. Harris, et al., 51-2022-CV-01563

***CAUTION: This email originated from an ocutside source. Do not click links or open attachments unless you know they
are safe ***

Received, thank you.
On Wed, Nov 9, 2022, 4:10 PM Latta, Nitra <NLatta@ndcourts.gov> wrote:

Mr. Harris:

This will acknowtedge receipt of your order for an appeal transcript of the hearings held on October 31 and
November 7,2022, in the above matter.

Pursuant to Rule 10[c] of the Rules of Appellate Procedure, | request advance payment for preparation of the
. transcripts on appeal. Payment information is provided in the attached invoice.





